
Dept Head tells Administrator 
over coffee that they need to 
purchase a new desk that has 

5 drawers

Administrator sends an email 
to the general Facilities 

mailbox notifying them of the 
need. Meanwhile, he takes an 

hour researching desks and 
finds a desk on Pottery Barn 

that he likes.

2 days later, someone checks 
the Facilities mailbox and 

routes the email to the 
“Furniture Expert”

The Furniture Expert sees the 
email a day later and sends an 

email to the Admin to
schedule time to view the

space

A week later, the Furniture 
Expert walks over to the 

building and measures the 
space for the desk

The Furniture Expert tells the 
Admin that the desk he liked 
will fit in the space and tells 

the Admin to create a 
shopping cart

The Admin goes to create a 
shopping cart and realizes that 

there are no desks with 5 
drawers available

The Admin prints out the 
options for desks and takes 

the pictures over to the Dept 
Head’s office. She is not there,

so he leaves the pictures on
her desk.

The Dept Head has been 
working remotely for 3 days, 
and finally comes back and 

sees the pictures.

Later that day, she tells the 
Administrator that any of 
these desks are fine, she 

didn’t really need 5 drawers-
just thought it would be nice

The Admin chooses one and 
initiates the purchase, using 

Facilities address as the 
shipping address

12 days later, the desk arrives 
to Facilities. No one knows 

who the desk is for, so it sits in 
the corner.

3 days later, the Admin 
reaches out to Facilities, 

saying she has been notified 
of delivery but doesn’t know 

where the desk is. They 
schedule a setup time.

5 days later, the desk is
brought to the space by 

Facilities.

The Troubles with Getting a Desk Delivered
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