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Laboratory #6 High Altitude Balloon Launch 
    The High Altitude Balloon Launch is the culmination of the five 
other laboratories.  Students learn to construct payloads out of 
foam and foam core while integrating sensors that were built from 
the previous laboratories.  We retrieved our payloads and 
temperature sensor data. 

 
 
 

Final Thoughts & Reflection 
    The work that I completed here at Boston University is 
important, as it provides a series of well-documented laboratories, 
aligned with Massachusetts and National Frameworks, to 
teachers.  These laboratories can be used to make science 
meaningful and create interest in space.   
    It was quite an experience to work with a partner in an active 
college research laboratory during the summer.  I learned many 
lessons, both professionally and personally, and will carry them 
with me for the rest of my life. 

 
Application to Teaching 

    Research is a large part of science, and I will be taking many 
aspects of the RET program and applying what I learned to the 
classroom.  I am going to allow more self-directed learning in the 
form of a research project.  The research project will focus on 
students picking a biological topic of their own interest and 
ultimately culminate in a presentation to the rest of the classroom 
about what the student learned. 
    From my own research, I will also be running the Cosmic Rays 
laboratory with my students during the 2012-2013 school year.  
Many students have trouble understanding tiny particles, and it 
would be beneficial for students to see these particles move as my 
class works to understand Biochemistry. 
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